Registered No. HSE/49. » [Price : Rs.2-00 Paise

e—so@ﬁ@érg ToesH| Bk
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-A EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No.1] AMARAVATI, MONDAY, 14" FEBRUARY, . 2022.

ANDHRA PRADESH BILLS
ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

The following Bill was introduced in the Andhra PradeSh
Legislative Assembly on 14™ March, 2022.

L. A. Bill No. 1 of 2022

A BILL FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH PUBLIC
EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION OF AGE OF SUPERANNUATION)
ACT, 1984,

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the
Seventy-Third Year of the Republic of India as follows,-

1. (1) ThisActmay be called the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulat:on Csmeﬁxn Zﬁf
of Age of Superannuation} (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come mto force on the 1% January 2022.

2 In the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulatlon of Age of Amendment of
Superannuatlon)Act 1984, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in  Section 3.
section 3,-

: Act23of 1984
(1) in sub-section(l), for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty two years”
shall be substituted. ;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted.

J-16/40 (1]



2 ‘ ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

(3) in sub-section (3),-

(@) for the words “sixty 'yearsf’, the words “sixty two years” shall be
substituted. :

(b)  in Explanation-ll, for words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted. :

(4) in sub-section(4),-

(a) in clause (a), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two
years” shall be substituted. S

(b)  in clause (b), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two

years” shall be substituted.
Amendment of : :

section 3A. 3. In the Principal Act,. in section 3A, in sub-section (2),-

(1) forthe words “fifty eight years”, the words “sixty one years” shall be,
substituted.

| (2) for the words “sixty years” wherever it occurs, the words “sixty two

years” shall be substituted.
Repeal of

OrdinanceNe.1 4, (1) The Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
: - Superannuation) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anYthing done or any action taken
under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or
taken under this Act. ' g

P



14" MARCH, 2022] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY : 2

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The age of superannuation of Government employees has been prescribed as 65
years vide the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation)
Act, 1984. For the Last Grade Service employees, the age of superannuation has been
fixed as 60 years. ‘

The Principal Act has been further amended during the year 2014 enhancing the age
of superannuation from 58 years to 60 years to the State Government employees etc., w.e.f
02.06.2014 vide the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
Superannuation) (Amendment) Act, 2014 (Act No 4 0f 2014);

There has been significant improvement in the average life expecténcy compared to
that in 2014. As per the world Health Organization, the 'global average life expectancy in
2019 around 73 years and the average Indian lived up to 70 years. There has been improved
health conditions in general'also;

It is considered that in order to utilize the experience and expe'rtise of the senior
employees and considering the increased life expectancy and improved health conditions in
general, proposed to enhance the current age of superannuation of 60 years to 62 years to
all the State Government employees covered under the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment
(Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984 and to give effect to the decision from
01.01.2022. In order to give effect to the above, it is necessary to promulgate an ordinance.

Clause 2 of the Bill seeks to give effect te the above decision.

Clause 3 of the Biii is necessitated as consequence to the amendment of the Clause
3A(2) by the State of Telangana in the- 1984 Act (in application to Telangana) by Act No.3
of 2021 which came into force w.e.f. 30.03.2021.

The subject matter needs immediate action in view of the fact that if necessary
amendments to the Statute are not immediately affected, the tenure and the retirement
dates of the serving public, servants would be affected. In view of the existing conditions
arising from the upsurge of covid in the immediate past, and the legislature of the State is not
in session, the above stated circumstances require immediate action.

Accordingly, it has been decided to amend the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment
(Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984(Act No. 23 of 1984) suitably.



4 : ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

As the Legislature was not then in session, having been prorogued, and it has been
decided to give effect to the above decision immediétely, the Andhra Pradesh Public
Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation) (Amendment) (A.P. Ordinance No.1 of
2022) was promulgated by the Governor on the 30" January,2022 which was published in
Andhra Pradesh Gazette dated 31% January, 2022. '

The Bill seeks to replace the said Ordinance and it give effect to the above decision.

BUGGANA RAJENDRANATH,
MINISTER FOR FINANCE, PLANNING,
COMMERCIAL TAXES AND
LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS.



14" MARCH, 2022) ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 5

MEMORANDUM UNDER RULE 95 OF THE RULES OF PROCEDURE AND
CONDUCT OF BUSINESS IN THE ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY.

The Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age 6f Superannuation)
(Amendment) Bill, 2022, afteritis passed by the Legislature of the State may be submitted

to the Governor for his assent under article 200 of the Constitution of India.

BUGGANA RAJENDRANATH,
MINISTER FOR FINANCE, PLANNING,
COMMERCIAL TAXES AND
LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS.

P. BALAKRISHNAMACHARYULU,
Secretary to State Legislature.



805 H3S deped
woESBS eiSwie
Se 800 Bey WGSBS SBSGSS
2022, Srg Jo, 145 885 HITDRLABE.

2022650 15 oSHSES ey

soHas (Henedaiyre @D Do Sasdy Lgasoé@ézsa) By,
198426: [o¥ET HHBoHLSS Dex.

S (Hesoresgd &) S-S BosEBEns® wol¥Hus o FESEOLOT

&3 [Bod DHoorr TRHSED > BeHolise: -
L (1) & Sgsnd eolfEds HesiEire (H6 D Sabiy
EHnfEsn) ($550) SigEn, 2022 €D HEPSHY.
@) 56, 2022 e5550 15 85 ol exbere’DB SYYiy FROBMESDD.
2. BOFBEE HepsiEire (BEd DHes BAHY Bonfssen) Sigdo
1984 (moth = Hotsey BT SHH DO 85 oaaéaéxmesﬁ -
o)) éso:—oab'a‘é)ts‘cﬁm (1)8° “0b3 HodEBLme” e Hisdne aé:mm
“i3 Both HoSE) e ek HEEODH oSS,

(2) @B-BOFSHED (2)6° “wvR vosHSHIer” @b Biisnet aibeorr

“oR Boh HosEBEne” e HEHveDH SoBBESo.
(8) &3-BoFySE (3)8°,~
Q) “eb3 SodHEsve” e HEEvedH wiberr ‘@83 Bod
BoBEBSwen” ik Histwed GoBSTD.

@) DEEESe-1IS" “0bl HodH)tsnen” o H5Smed athenrr “ebl
- Botd :'6055&5_3655»00” % HBEVOD BoBIB.

(4) &B-$BFsSD (4)8°-

(@) PokLm (D)S° “©BR BoRHBKmen” e HiSoed otbeor™ “@bn

Both JoHEBoen” ©d HBHneD GoSSBo.

@) motisn B “wbp SosESines” ek Hiitnot atheorr ‘o83
Both HoBEySHmen” o DTN SOSSBS.

3. (B Sigd 8D 963‘365&\11553 éas-o"aaai_)css’m (2)6%,-
(1) “o8 DB Sosyssne” ol HBooh atﬁ:e»m “@53 88
BoBEBEoen” el HiEned SoSSSH.
(@) “wnp sostysine” e Bt aibesr o9 K S,
“©B3 Both HobHBsnen” o HBSved GoSSBH.
4. SoBBEE HepsiEiyre (BB8D e Sy Léf»a:%&ém) ($55%¢e9)
OEFREi, 2022 BoHaORN® Bty BobEHIB.

(2) o8 55s ﬁoaaocso Show, H BrEEsn Boks DS B0
Gy éméo:é;ﬁ)’cﬁ&) By & ~z.’:é.ao 1Bos B St EHHHAT™ grloBDESSD.

Lk,

Solismrdosne
Sobcsn (etogisin.

)

19846°0 285
S,

85 SoTysKwEH
S5,

20226°9 15



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

SETe - TP
solH(HBE @gﬁé‘sﬁ%rwv (Be5D DEom By EaiEben) Sk,
1984 ey [Hebdy a&ldeo B8 Dbe Sy 55 SobEysdmenry.

DEPESEDE L o0 gty Gt 385 aalybe 5D DBHm écﬁ:;'oaéo
60 HosEssnenrr HEanoDSa.

solHHBS [Heb8 Ehrre (S5 Do BT Lééoaaééﬁa) (555¢9)
Bigi5, 2014 (20146°0 45 Sigism) T 02-06-2014 S0l oo Beddy
asgben Boderd 08 HBd Ddve Schiiydd 58 BosEime ok 60

«aoéégﬁa’meéa othdr 20149 :ooa’aégéa‘més o B30 'é\aéé'}"
: KHBoBEDBG.

20146° 626&% £ sveaéwés QGQ)ESQ)& $en 228 osnst
BEPESEAS Doibrse o, Wos 6By ¥oy o 20196°
(D008 Biken S8 oo T 78 HosEBmen HOKH FrE8D
- %en £98 sroin 70 SodEBsvenre yothis, Jerte "@55?13 E’aﬁ%&eﬁo

DERDD.

50005 aBi5rHe oHEsEn HBa TR IEFRODHESHEOTTH
850 1OAS £08 sodnd, DHHBES Frrdn ety $BRHODH
HOKeBSiIB BHTMwSr, solgEEs HEHeiEyre (55D 8B Sobity
Eomisses) Sigsn, 1084 Bots $3) v Bandy a6Tbeotd (EkE Bi8d
Dioes SSHK> 60 Bosdpme ol 62 SodESEmets OBHBHEI
$oB0%0 $68 Doty 01-01-2022 H08 ®iver TS
(BOFBoSLEBLD JogS*DoSEDEH. D BBFEEH whenddHbthrd &
TSR ELNS BUcne BBFEToR0HB.

Depd®R 25 poiin P VY oHenBarod aTBRHA.

30-08-2021 %ol eHers®d8 HYS 20216° 8% Sge L,
Boorre® TG0 1984 5t35006° (Booreet $580%) $otixn 35 (25 $SBoDS
Seisrdore, Deps™ 83 potéin eBEED 0.

SeP0B SBHEDS Bieoen Epdh SQ0HE'E OB, BipEs adoo
‘ atﬁﬁ)svoo LoBdsn e&%K DB Bden (HarEHHBHI 3)‘2(355‘@53%53

HoHED (HABHS' DHOIFoLEND Ee St BE BRI ©SSEINHD.
K50% Bbo weos® F08 estyfor By AHS T Doy BRE
564D GRE® oHED HBAL T DR JirBEine® Blothisite,
TS BODS $ORHeD SEp S5 HHE VOB BBES0HE.



14" MARCH, 2022] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

E5%>Bore, wolBHES BepshEhre (85D 8B SaHy
EbomBEtes) S, 1984 (19846°0 235 S0} #HBBP S8BoOD
3)60»065&5@26&5

BHHOLD DESHEOT TFoNTTHE WP ‘oa’)pé-goés BhotSE,
P DParRY ot emerSared VewoDots, esse 30, 20228 8%
gFe)a SOHEE @aﬁﬁs‘sﬁsémv (gmsfa Does B (5&’::33%%696) (%5%es)
oerBEim, 2022 (20226° 15 eolHEE errBiin)d wbisd. b
2550 81, 20225 BES eollHRE RBGS® HHbobadSa.

Ealey @mgﬁ%é:o 23926&)55 @3‘63:63&&:6 Den D Sﬁ@@@&mﬁm&
&850

el TROTR

esgé, B8 5B
B BgeForen B
ey Do TP ro(@.



<40 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY ' [PART IV-A

oSS T8sE YBah Bk e JehErSDE’D

955 Do (Both Dides.

SOBIEES HepBiEiyre (565 Db Sabiy) Ednfsse) (55m)
Den, 20225 g FSSLOED SN bikyh Fr5E SoDPHENE’R 2008
SSHFSED (B0l ©HHB Ao KSHHH HBYoHBD.*

entfid RS
oBs, Hed8 bk
TS5 SgiForen $B0
ardeyy Hipe = Hol@.

. mq;@w&%m

oag BPBOD DOOLBO saq,cSa,a.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press, Amaravati.



